AB-2017-06
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS FOR CONCRETE

CITY OF BARTOW
BID TABULATION

NOVEMBER 14, 2017

READY MIX CONCRETE

2500 PSI Regular/Per Cubic Yard
3000 PSI Regular/Per Cubic Yard
4000 PSI Regular/Per Cubic Yard
3000 Pump Mix/Per Cubic Yard

4000 PSI Pump Mix/Per Cubic Yard
3000 Curb Blend/Per Cubic Yard

250 PSI Flow Fill Pump/Per Cubic Yard
Flowable Fill Exc./Per Cubic Yard

57 Stone/Per Cubic Yard

READY MIX DELIVERY

Minimum Load < 5 Yards
Fuel Surcharge Per Load
Split Load Fee
Environmental Fee
Plant Opening -
Holding Charge

After Hours Charge
Wrecker Charge
Diversion Charge

EXTRA PRODUCTS
Commericial Fiber/Yd.

PUMP CRETE
JOBS ONLY

BOOM PUMP 32 METER

Minimum Charge
Set-Up Fee Per Job
Pump Time Per Job
Fuel

Prime Pack

Pump Fee Per Yard

$750.00 (7:00 a.m. - 2:00 P.M. - Saturday)
$75.00 (After 2 Hours)
$150.00/HR. - 4 Hour Minimum

$400.00 Flat (9:00 a.m. - 4:00 p.m. up to 20 yds

KMR CONCRETE, INC.
BARTOW, FL

$100.00
$102.00
$106.00
$107.00
$112.00
$104.00
$88.00
$83.00
$50.00

$100.00
Included
$75.00

Included

As Needed
$75.00

$6.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid




AB-2017-06
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS FOR CONCRETE

CITY OF BARTOW NOVEMBER 14, 2017
BID TABULATION

SMALL LINE PUMPS

Minimum

Set-Up Fee

Pump Time Per Hour
Fuel

Patching Holes for Lintels
Pump Fee Per Yard

Terms:

Prices Firm _
Percentage of Escalation Anticipated
Exceptions To Bid

$300.00 (Includes 2 Men)
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Net 30
Yes
None Listed
Additional Requirements For Pump Operation
Will Be Quoted As Needed




